Cobb County School District

Tabulation Sheet

IFB 17-53, HVAC Air Filters

Vendor Name

American Air Filter Company, Inc.

FilterPro USA

Terms Net 30 Net 30
Item Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Specify paeiglilei ) U (_:OSt Extended Cost Specify Specify Model/Part Number Unit _COSt Extended Cost
# Manufacturer Number per Filter Manufacturer per Filter
Group 1 - Air Filters with MERV 7 Rating
Paint booth intak | ring diffusi
1 ﬂft'; ©0th Intake panel ring dittusion 40 ACT-203 20x20x1 AAF 523-700-200 $3.25 $130.00|  Carpenter FPPBDDC-20X20X1 $2.00 $80.00
2 |Polyester panel filter 12 IN-104 20x25x1 AAF 279-800-051 $2.35 $28.20 TriDim FPPNL1L2P-20X25 $4.21 $50.52
3 |2” fiberglass filter 192 PA-203 20x20x2 AAF 198-700-052 $1.45 $278.40 Grainger FPFBRGLSS2-20X20X2 $2.42 $464.64
1” polyester high, effici ti-
polyester hugh, etliciency anti 52,900 | AM100-PM 2021 415 sq. in. AAF 358-51-20A21A $1.20 $63,480.00|  Carpenter FPPOLYMSAMTI1-1X1X1 $1.25 $66,125.00
4 |microbial, with tackifier treatment
1” roll, polyester high, effici ti-
5 [T roly polyesterhigh, efmiciency ant 20 AM100-R25 | 25inch X 90 ft. roll AAF 357-051-250 $44.00 $880.00|  Carpenter | FPPOLYM8AMT1-25X1080X1 $45.90 $918.00
microbial, with tackifier treatment
2” roll, polyester high, effici ti-
ot POYEStEr igh, Efticiency antl 5 VL-OR2AM25 | 25 inch X 60 ft. roll AAF 357-052-250 $68.00 $340.00| Carpenter | FPPOLYM8AMT2-25X0720X2 $37.80 $189.00
6 [microbial, with tackifier treatment
2” filter, polyester high, efficiency anti- .
7 . ) 8 . 70,500 VL-0R2AMA415 415 sq.in. AAF 358-52-21A20A $2.29 $161,445.00 Carpenter FPPOLYM8AMT2-2X2X2 $1.75 $123,375.00
microbial, with tackifier treatment
%" filter polyester high, efficiency anti- .
. . ; i 288 AM50-PM1119 208 sq. in. AAF 358-51-15al15a $1.30 $374.40 Carpenter FPPOLYM8AMT1-1X1X1 $1.25 $360.00
3 microbial, with tackifier treatment
| fil | i mi ial
g [Sleevefilter, polyester, anti microbia 2,208 R-104 501 sq. in. AAF 233-01-20a25A $2.42 $5,343.36|  Carpenter FPSLEEVE-1X1 $1.25 $2,760.00
with tackifier, treatment
10 |1” standard capacity, pleated filter 40 MX40-STD-20201 20x20x1 AAF 173-700-011 $2.72 $108.80| FilterPro USA 20201PL8S $2.18 $87.20
11 |2” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20252 20x25x2 AAF 173-112-800 $3.15 $422.10| FilterPro USA 20252PL8S $2.74 $367.16
12 |4” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20254 20x25x4 AAF 179-480-800 $6.15 $824.10| FilterPro USA 20254PL8S $4.21 $564.14
Group Total $233,654.36 $195,340.66
Item Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Specify pEzigliedileng) U (_:OSt Extended Cost Specify Specify Model/Part Number Unit FOSt Extended Cost
# Manufacturer Number per Filter Manufacturer per Filter
Group 1 - Air Filters with MERV 8 Rating
Paint booth intak | ring diffusi
1 ﬁft'gr ©0th Intake panel ring dittusion 40 ACT-203 20x20x1 AAF 523-700-200 $3.25 $130.00|  Carpenter FPPBDDC-20X20X1 $1.50 $60.00
Polyester panel filter 12 IN-104 20x25x1 AAF 279-800-051 $2.35 $28.20 TriDim FPPNL1L2P-20X25 $4.21 $50.52
2” fiberglass filter 192 PA-203 20x20x2 AAF 198-700-052 $1.45 $278.40 Grainger FPFBRGLSS2-20X20X2 $2.42 $464.64
1” polyester high, effici ti-
POTyester hugh, eticiency anti 52,900 | AM100-PM 2021 415 sq. in. AAF 358-51-20A21A $1.20 $63,480.00|  Carpenter FPPOLYMSAMT1-1X1X1 $66,125.00
4 |microbial, with tackifier treatment $1.25
1” roll, polyester high, effici ti-
5 |1 fo Polvesterhigh, eficiency anti 20 AM100-R25 | 25 inch X 90 ft. roll AAF 357-051-250 $44.00 $880.00|  Carpenter FPPOLYMSAMT1-25X1080X1 $918.00
microbial, with tackifier treatment $45.90
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Cobb County School District
Tabulation Sheet
IFB 17-53, HVAC Air Filters

Vendor Name

American Air Filter Company, Inc.

FilterPro USA

Terms Net 30 Net 30
Item Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Specify paeiglilei ) U (_:OSt Extended Cost Specify Specify Model/Part Number Unit _COSt Extended Cost
# Manufacturer Number per Filter Manufacturer per Filter
2” roll lyester high, effici ti-
[foll, polyester high, etticiency anti 5 VL-OR2AM25 | 25 inch X 60 ft. roll AAF 357-052-250 $68.00 $340.00|  Carpenter FPPOLYMSAMT2-25X0720X2 $189.00
6 |microbial, with tackifier treatment $37.80
2” filter, polyester high, efficiency anti- .
7 . . ) o 70,500 VL-OR2AMA415 415 sq.in. AAF 358-52-21A20A $2.29 $161,445.00 Carpenter FPPOLYM8AMT2-2X2X2 $123,375.00
microbial, with tackifier treatment
$1.75
%" filter polyester high, efficiency anti- .
. . ) o 288 AM50-PM1119 208 sq. in. AAF 358-51-15al15a $1.30 $374.40 Carpenter FPPOLYM8AMT1-1X1X1 $360.00
microbial, with tackifier treatment
8 $1.25
| fil | i mi ial
g |Sleevefilter, polyester, anti microbia 2,208 R-104 501 sq. in. AAF 233-01-20a25A $2.42 $5,343.36|  Carpenter FPSLEEVE-1X1 $2,760.00
with tackifier, treatment $1.25
10 |1” standard capacity, pleated filter 40 MX40-STD-20201 20x20x1 AAF 173-700-011 $2.72 $108.80| FilterPro USA 20201PL8S $2.18 $87.20
11 |2” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20252 20x25x2 AAF 173-112-800 $3.15 $422.10| FilterPro USA 20252PL8S $2.74 $367.16
12 |4” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20254 20x25x4 AAF 179-480-800 $6.15 $824.10| FilterPro USA 20254PL8S $4.21 $564.14
Group Total $233,654.36 $195,320.66
Item Frame Description Part # Frame Size Specify Specify Model/Part | Unit (_:OSt Extended Cost Specify Specify Model/Part Number Unit (,:OSt Extended Cost
# Manufacturer Number per Filter Manufacturer per Filter
Group 2 - Frames
1” galvanized fi ith metal retai
13 griga vanizedirame with metal retainer 30| SLGPF11625 16x25x1 AAF 316-001-600 $8.50 $255.00| FilterPro USA FPFRAME-16X25X1 $6.00 $180.00
2” galvanized steel f ith metal
1 retif’n‘;”g':iz steelirame with meta 30|  SLGPF22025 20x25x2 AAF 316-002-800 $12.00 $360.00| FilterPro USA FPFRAME-20X25X2 $6.00 $180.00
Group Total $615.00 $360.00
Grand Total - Group 1, Air Filters with Merv 8 Rating and Group 2 Frames $234,269.36 $195,680.66

Percentage discount below MSRP for related items purchased during the contract period not

15 [noted in this solicitation as stated in Special Terms & Conditions Section 8.9

20% MU

Please Indicate Delivery Time Upon Receipt of Purchase Order:

5-10 DAYS ARO

2 weeks

Awarded items highlighted
Award based on grand totals for Air Filters with MERV 8 Rating and Frames
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Cobb County School District

Tabulation Sheet

IFB 17-53, HVAC Air Filters

Vendor Name

Filters for Industry, Inc.

Terms 1%-10/Net 30
Item . . . X Specify i Unit Cost per Unit Cost per Filter Extended Cost
# Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Manufacturer Specify Model/Part Number Filter Extended Cost 1% Disc. 10 Days 1% Disc. 10 Days
Group 1 - Air Filters with MERV 7 Rating
Paint booth intak | ring diffusi
1 |} 2Intbooth Intake paneiring diftusion 40 ACT-203 20x20x1 FFI $2.99 $119.60 $2.96 $118.40
filter DPP-2020
2 |Polyester panel filter 12 IN-104 20x25x1 FFI DPP-2025 $3.19 $38.28 $3.16 $37.90
3 |2” fiberglass filter 192 PA-203 20x20x2 FILGRP FG-200 $0.69 $132.48 $0.68 $131.16
1” polyester high, efficiency anti- .
2 AM100-PM 2021 41 .in. FILGRP . . . .
4_|microbial, with tackifier treatment >2,900 00-PM 20 > s-in ¢ VL-09PSTDL-AM 2099 »52,371.00 »0.98 °51,847.29
1” roll, polyester high, efficiency anti- )
2 AM100-R2 2 h X 90 ft. roll FILGRP . . . .
> microbial, with tackifier treatment 0 00-R25 > inch XS0 ft. ro G VL-09PSTDL-AM 532.48 »649.60 »32.16 »643.10
2” roll, polyester high, efficiency anti- )
VL-OR2AM2 2 h X 60 ft. roll FILGRP . . . .
6 |microbial, with tackifier treatment > 0 > | 25inch X60ft.ro 6 VL-019PSTDL-AM 23298 5164.90 232,65 >163.25
2" fil | high, effici i-
7 |1°" t‘:;' Ip N ytehs tterk_'f f 'ct'encyta”t' 70,500 | VI-0R2AM415 415 squin. FILGRP $1.33 $93,765.00 $1.32 $92,827.35
microbial, with tackifier treatmen VL-019PSTDL-AM
w" fil | high, effici i-
% ) ' te.r po YeSter _'g_ » efficiency antl 288 AMS50-PM1119 208 sq. in. FILGRP $0.89 $256.32 $0.88 $253.76
microbial, with tackifier treatment
8 VL-BT3.3
g |Mleevefilter, polyester, anti microbial 2,208 R-104 501 sq. in FFI $1.91 $4,217.28 $1.89 $4,175.11
with tackifier, treatment ' a-1n- BT3.3-7-XXXX ' e ‘ =12
10 |1” standard capacity, pleated filter 40 MX40-STD-20201 20x20x1 QUALITY EQP4020201 $2.32 $92.80 $2.30 $91.87
11 |2” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20252 20x25x2 QUALITY EQP4020252 $2.99 $400.66 $2.96 $396.65
12 |4” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20254 20x25x4 QUALITY EQP4020254 $4.99 $668.66 $4.94 $661.97
Group Total $152,876.58 $151,347.81
Item . . . i Specify i Unit Cost per Unit Cost per Filter Extended Cost
# Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Manufacturer Specify Model/Part Number Filter Extended Cost 1% Disc. 10 Days 1% Disc. 10 Days
Group 1 - Air Filters with MERV 8 Rating
Paint booth intake panel ring diffusion
1 filter 40 ACT-203 20x20x1 FFI DPP-2020 $2.99 $119.60 $2.96 $118.40
2 |Polyester panel filter 12 IN-104 20x25x1 FFI DPP-2025 $3.19 $38.28 $3.16 $37.90
3 |2” fiberglass filter 192 PA-203 20x20x2 FILGRP FG-200 $0.69 $132.48 $0.68 $131.16
1” polyester high, efficiency anti- .
4 |microbial, with tackifier treatment 52,900 | AM100-PM 2021 415 sq. in. FILGRP AVANT-M8-AM $1.19 $62,951.00 $1.18 $62,321.49
1” roll, polyester high, efficiency anti- .
5 microbial, with tackifier treatment 20 AM100-R25 25 inch X 90 ft. roll FILGRP AVANT-M8-AM $41.99 $839.80 $41.57 $831.40
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Cobb County School District
Tabulation Sheet
IFB 17-53, HVAC Air Filters

Vendor Name

Filters for Industry, Inc.

Terms 1%-10/Net 30
Item . . . X Specify i Unit Cost per Unit Cost per Filter Extended Cost
# Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Manufacturer Specify Model/Part Number Filter Extended Cost 1% Disc. 10 Days 1% Disc. 10 Days
2" roll, polyester high, efficiency anti- 5 VL-OR2AM25 | 25 inch X 60 ft. roll FFI/FIBRIX $41.99 $209.95 $41.57 $207.85
6 |microbial, with tackifier treatment ’ 200UHJOTG150M-OWG ’ ' ’ '
2” filter, polyester high, efficiency anti- .
7 microbial with tackifier treatment 70,500 VL-OR2AMA415 415 sq.in. FFI/FIBRIX $1.49 $105,045.00 $1.48 $103,994.55
’ 200UHJOTG150M-OWG
%" filt lyester high, effici ti-
72" filter polyester high, efficiency anti 288 AMS50-PM1119 208 sq. in. FIBRIX $0.89 $256.32 $0.88 $253.76
microbial, with tackifier treatment
8 75UDT55-ST
g [Steeve filter, polyester, anti microbial 2,208 R-104 501 sq. in FFI $2.39 $5,277.12 $2.37 $5,224.35
with tackifier, treatment ! g-1n- DPS-XXXX ’ e ’ e
10 |1” standard capacity, pleated filter 40 MX40-STD-20201 20x20x1 QUALITY EQP4020201 $2.32 $92.80 $2.30 $91.87
11 |2” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20252 20x25x2 QUALITY EQP4020252 2.99 $400.66 $2.96 $396.65
12 |4” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20254 20x25x4 QUALITY EQP4020254 4.99 $668.66 $4.94 $661.97
Group Total $176,031.67 $174,271.35
Item . . Specify . Unit Cost per Unit Cost per Filter Extended Cost
F D Part # F fy M I/Part N E
M rame Description art rame Size Manufacturer Specify Model/Part Number Filter xtended Cost 1% Disc. 10 Days 1% Disc. 10 Days
Group 2 - Frames
1” galvanized frame with metal retainer
13 |grid 30 SLGPF11625 16x25x1 VER-MAC ECG-16251 $5.75 $172.50 $5.69 $170.78
2” galvanized steel frame with metal
. R 30 SLGPF22025 20x25x2 VER-MAC ECG-20252 $7.39 $221.70 $7.32 $219.48
14 (retainer grid
Group Total $394.20 $390.26
Grand Total - Group 1, Air Filters with Merv 8 Rating and Group 2 Frames $176,425.87| $174,661.61
Percentage discount below MSRP for related items purchased during the contract period not
15 |noted in this solicitation as stated in Special Terms & Conditions Section 8.9 Our net cost, plus 20%, INCLUDING FREIGHT

Please Indicate Delivery Time Upon Receipt of Purchase Order:

10 working days from receipt of purchase order

Awarded items highlighted
Award based on grand totals for Air Filters with MERV 8 Rating and Frames
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Cobb County School District

Tabulation Sheet
IFB 17-53, HVAC Air Filters

Vendor Name Koch Filter Underwood HVAC Inc.
Terms Net 30 Net 30
Item Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Specify ey el Unit (_:OSt per Extended Cost Specify SR A e Unit FOSt per Extended Cost
# Manufacturer Number Filter Manufacturer Number Filter
Group 1 - Air Filters with MERV 7 Ratin
Paint booth intake panel ring diffusion . .
1 ], 40 ACT-203 20x20x1 Koch Filter 132-2020-01 3.25 130.12 Tridim 7.94 317.60
filter 2 053202001 > >
2 |Polyester panel filter 12 IN-104 20x25x1 Koch Filter 284-200-250 2.09 $25.07 Tridim PP2025 $3.95 $47.40
3 |2” fiberglass filter 192 PA-203 20x20x2 Koch Filter 276-200-200 0.50 $96.00 Tridim 0612020TG-L $2.49 $478.08
1” polyester high, efficiency anti- . . . -
4 |microbial, with tackifier treatment 52,900 | AM100-PM 2021 415 sq. in. Koch Filter 550-020-020 1.27 $67,313.22 NC Filtration NCME $2.05| $108,445.00
1” roll, polyester high, efficiency anti- : . . -
5 microbial, with tackifier treatment 20 AM100-R25 25 inch X 90 ft. roll Koch Filter 550-025-90 55.28 $1,105.50 NC Filtration NCMEBR $115.00 $2,300.00
2” roll, polyester high, efficiency anti- : . . -
6 |microbial, with tackifier treatment 5 VL-0R2AM25 25 inch X 60 ft. roll Koch Filter 570-025-60 54.32 $271.58 NC Filtration NCMEBR $92.00 $460.00
2” filter, polyester high, efficiency anti- . . . ;
7 . . . I 70,500 VL-OR2AM415 415 sq.in. Koch Filter 570-020-021 1.77 $125,132.08 NC Filtration $2.85 $200,925.00
microbial, with tackifier treatment
NCME
%" fil I high, effici i-
7 filter polyester high, efficiency anti- | »gg | A\is0-pM1119 208 sq. in. Koch Filter 574-011-019 0.73 $211.30|  NC Filtration $0.882 $254.02
microbial, with tackifier treatment
8 NCME
| fil | i mi ial
g [Sleevefilter, polyester, anti microbia 2,208 R-104 501 sq. in. Koch Filter 115-724-903 12.96 $28,620.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
with tackifier, treatment
10 |1” standard capacity, pleated filter 40 MX40-STD-20201 20x20x1 Koch Filter 102-700-008 3.18 $127.05 Tridim 2302020140 $3.55 $142.00
11 |2” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20252 20x25x2 Koch Filter 102-700-021 3.56 $477.46 Tridim 2302025240 $4.20 $562.80
12 [4” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20254 20x25x4 Koch Filter 102-700-030 7.22 $966.96 Tridim 2302025440 $6.49 $869.66
Group Total $224,476.77 $314,801.56
Item Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Specify SNl Unit (_:OSt per Extended Cost Specify geeaiviiiudlias Unit FOSt per Extended Cost
# Manufacturer Number Filter Manufacturer Number Filter
Group 1 - Air Filters with MERV 8 Ratin
Paint booth intake panel ring diffusion . .
1 filter 40 ACT-203 20x20x1 Koch Filter 132-2020-01 $3.25 $130.12 Tridim 053202001 $7.94 $317.60
2 |Polyester panel filter 12 IN-104 20x25x1 Koch Filter 284-200-250 $2.51 $30.07 Tridim PP2025 $3.95 $47.40
3 |27 fiberglass filter 192 PA-203 20x20x2 Koch Filter 276-200-200 $2.02 $388.52 Tridim 06120202TG-1 $2.49 $478.08
1” polyester high, efficiency anti- . . . .
4 |microbial, with tackifier treatment 52,900 | AM100-PM 2021 415 sq. in. Koch Filter 575-020-021 $1.18 $62,299.92 NC Filtration NCME $2.10 $111,090.00
1” roll, polyester high, efficiency anti- . . . .
5 microbial, with tackifier treatment 20 AM100-R25 25 inch X 90 ft. roll Koch Filter  575-025-90 $45.93 $918.63 NC Filtration NCMEBR $118.00 $2,360.00
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Cobb County School District

Tabulation Sheet
IFB 17-53, HVAC Air Filters

Vendor Name Koch Filter Underwood HVAC Inc.
Terms Net 30 Net 30
Item Filter Description Est. Qty Part # Average Filter Size Specify ey el Unit (_:OSt per Extended Cost Specify SR A e Unit FOSt per Extended Cost
# Manufacturer Number Filter Manufacturer Number Filter
2” roll, polyester high, efficiency anti- X . . X
6 |microbial, with tackifier treatment 5 VL-OR2AM25 25 inch X 60 ft. roll Koch Filter 570-025-60 $54.32 $271.58 NC Filtration NCMEBR $94.00 $470.00
7 im:rlézralp?/:/f:ttzrclzlf?:r f:::t';"::ta”t" 70,500 | VL-OR2AMA415 415 sq.in. Koch Filter $125,132.08|  NC Filtration $176,250.00
’ 570-020-022 $1.77 NCME $2.50
% filt lyester high, effici ti-
:\ icr'osir;ow‘;te; tZ::k;ﬁe;:r;:'lc:e(:Ztan ' 288 AMS50-PM1119 208 sq. in. Koch Filter $211.30|  NC Filtration $259.20
8 ’ 574-011-019 $0.73 NCME $0.90
Sleeve filter, polyester, anti microbial . . ) . . .
9 with tackifier, treatment 2,208 R-104 501 sq. in. Koch Filter 115-724-903 $12.96 $28,620.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 |1” standard capacity, pleated filter 40 MX40-STD-20201 20x20x1 Koch Filter 102-700-008 $3.18 $127.05 NC Filtration NC8PLS20201 $2.45 $98.00
11 |2” standard capacity, pleated filter 134 MX40-STD-20252 20x25x2 Koch Filter 102-700-021 $3.56 $477.46 NC8PLS20252 $3.05 $408.70
12 |4” standard capacity, pleated filter 134  |MX40-STD-20254 20x25x4 Koch Filter 102-700-030 $7.22 $966.96 NC8PLS20254 $5.25 $703.50
Group Total $219,574.13 $292,482.48
Item Frame Description Part # Frame Size Specify Specify Model/Part Unit (_:ost per Extended Cost Specify Specify Model/Part Unit (-:ost per Extended Cost
# Manufacturer Number Filter Manufacturer Number Filter
Group 2 - Frames
1” galvanized fi ith metal retai
13 grija vanizedirame with metat retainer 30| SLGPF11625 16x25x1 Koch Filter 116-700-002 $8.58 $257.38 Clarcor B102 $10.85 $325.50
2" galvanized steel f ith metal
galvanized steel frame with meta 30| SLGPF22025 20x25x2 Koch Filter 116-700.010 $10.89 $326.56 C;arcpr B204 $15.25 $457.50
14 (retainer grid
Group Total $583.94 $783.00
Grand Total - Group 1, Air Filters with Merv 8 Rating and Group 2 Frames $220,158.07 $293,265.48
Percentage discount below MSRP for related items purchased during the contract period not
15 [noted in this solicitation as stated in Special Terms & Conditions Section 8.9 .30 MP
Please Indicate Delivery Time Upon Receipt of Purchase Order: 4-25 Bus Days ARO 4-6 weeks

Awarded items highlighted
Award based on grand totals for Air Filters with MERV 8 Rating and Frames
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