
Tabsheet Cobb County School District
B2045, Fleet Maintenance Fluids and Lubricants

ITEM 
#

UNIT OF 
MEASUR

E
EST 

QTY. 
MFG./

PKG. SIZE

TOTAL 
COST PER 

PKG.

UNIT COST 
PER 

GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL 
COST PER 

PKG.

UNIT COST 
PER 

GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL 
COST PER 

PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. 
SIZE

TOTAL 
COST 
PER 
PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

1  Gallon 275 Purus FS 
ATF

 55-Drum

$1,034.55 $18.81 $5,172.75 Chevron 
Delo Syn 
ATF HD 
Drum

$704.00 
Drum

$12.80 $3,520.00 BP
Drum

$1,521.30 $27.66 $7,606.50 Drum $26.76 $7,359.00 

2  Gallon 3500 BH ATF 
DEXIII 

55-Drum & 
Bulk

$284.90 
Drum

$5.18 per 
Gal Drum
$4.63 per 
Gal Bulk

$18,130.00 Chevron 
MD3-ATF 

Bulk

Bulk $3.89 $13,615.00 Compass
Bulk

Bulk $5.99 $20,965.00 Bulk $5.33 $18,655.00 

3  Gallon 8500 BH 
15W40CK4 
55-Drum & 

Bulk

$330.00
Drum

$6.06 per 
Gal Drum
$5.26 per 
Gal Bulk

$51,510.00 Chevron 
Super Plus 
EC 15W40

Bulk $4.98 $42,330.00 Compass
Bulk

$4.10 $4.10 $34,850.00 Bulk $6.26 $53,210.00 

4 Gallon 1200 BH 5W20SB 
55-Drum & 

Bulk

$263.45
Drum

$4.79 per 
Gal Drum
$3.99 per 
Gal Bulk

$5,748.00 Chevron 
Supreme 

5W20 Bulk

Bulk $4.50 $5,400.00 Compass
Bulk

$3.45 $3.45 $4,140.00 Bulk $4.89 $5,868.00 

5 Gallon 225 BH 10W30 
SB 

55-Drum & 
Bulk

$263.45
Drum

$4.79 per 
Gal Drum
$3.99 per 
Gal Bulk

$1,077.75 Chevron 
Supreme 

10W30 Bulk

Bulk $4.50 $1,012.50 Compass
Bulk

$3.45 $3.45 $776.25 Bulk $4.89 $1,100.25 

6  Gallon 7000 Peak FG
 55-Drum

$506.55
Drum

$9.21 $64,470.00 Chevron 
ELC 50/50 

Drums/Bulk

$329.45 
Drum/Bulk

$5.99 $41,930.00 *Zerex
Bulk

$5.25 $5.25 $36,750.00 Bulk $6.76 $47,320.00 

7 Gallon 
Totes

3300 Blue Sky 
55-Drum & 

Bulk

$112.20
Drum

$2.04 per 
Gal Drum
$1.24 per 
Gal Bulk

$6,732.00 Bulk Bulk $1.20 $3,960.00 Musket
Bulk

$1.05 $1.05 $3,465.00 Bulk $1.30 $4,290.00 

Burkett Oil Company Inc.
Net 30 Days

24 Hours

Pugh Lubricants, LLC
dba Cadence Petroleum

Net 30 Days
48 Hours

Northeast Lubricants, LTD.
Net 30 Days

1-3 Business Days

GROUP 1 - FLUIDS 

Brewer Hendly Oil Co.
Net 30 Days

3 Business Days or 72 Hours

Motor Oil – 10W30 Motor Oil per 
specifications in Section 3.3.3 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Synthetic Automatic Transmission 
Fluid per specifications in Section 3.1 
or CCSD approved equivalent.

Automatic Transmission Fluid per 
specifications in Section 3.2 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Vendor:
Terms:

Delivery Time:

Motor Oil - Heavy Duty AE 15W40 
ONLY per specifications in Section 
3.3.1

Motor Oil - 5W20 Motor Oil per 
specifications in Section 3.3.2 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

DESCRIPTION

Coolant – Extended Life 
Coolant/Antifreeze per specifications 
in Section 3.4 or CCSD approved 
equivalent.

Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) - Per 
specifications in Section 3.5 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yellow.
*Does not meet CCSD specifications.
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District
B2045, Fleet Maintenance Fluids and Lubricants

ITEM 
#

UNIT OF 
MEASUR

E
EST 

QTY. 
MFG./

PKG. SIZE

TOTAL 
COST PER 

PKG.

UNIT COST 
PER 

GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL 
COST PER 

PKG.

UNIT COST 
PER 

GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL 
COST PER 

PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. 
SIZE

TOTAL 
COST 
PER 
PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

Burkett Oil Company Inc.
Net 30 Days

24 Hours

Pugh Lubricants, LLC
dba Cadence Petroleum

Net 30 Days
48 Hours

Northeast Lubricants, LTD.
Net 30 Days

1-3 Business Days

Brewer Hendly Oil Co.
Net 30 Days

3 Business Days or 72 Hours

Vendor:
Terms:

Delivery Time:

DESCRIPTION

1 Pound 1000 Purus 
Alletor 
EP#2 

120 Keg & 
400 LB 
Drum

$271.20 
per Keg
$684.00 

per Drum

$2.26 per 
LB

$1.71 per 
LB

$1,710.00 Chevron 
Delo 

Starplex 
EPII

400#/120#

$668.00
400LB
 Drum

$200.40
120LB Keg

$1.67 $1,670.00 Texas Red
Drum
Keg

$652.00
$195.60

$1.63 $1,001.63 Drum $2.37 $2,370.00

2 Gallon 110 Purus 
85W140
55-Drum

$477.40 
per Drum

$8.68 $954.80 Chevron 
Delo Gear 

EP-5 
80W90

400#/120#

$551.65
55-Gal 
Drum

($1.38/LB)

$10.03 $1,103.30 Compass
Drum 

$6.58
$362.05

$6.58 $116.58 Drum $9.17 $1,008.70

1

GROUP 2 – LUBRICANTS

Lubricant –Universal Gear SAE 85W-
140 per specifications in Section 3.7 
or CCSD approved equivalent.

GROUP 3 – RELATED ITEMS
$141,180.95$109,670.96$114,540.80$155,505.30

Grease – Chevron Delo Grease EP 
NLGI 2 per specifications in Section 
3.6 or CCSD approved equivalent. 

Per Section 7.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in 
the event CCSD has failed to include an item(s), 
responding vendors are asked to provide a fee 
structure for additional, related items that may be 
purchased during the award period.  Vendors are to 
identify the pricing source and the associated fee 
structure in the space to the right. Example responses:  
X% discount below MSRP; X% discount below 
published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up.  

NOTE:

No Response Cost Plus 10% Mark-Up Cost Plus 10% 30% Off

Total Cost Based off Estimated Total Usage

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yellow.
*Does not meet CCSD specifications.
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District
B2045, Fleet Maintenance Fluids and Lubricants

ITEM 
#

UNIT OF 
MEASUR

E
EST 

QTY. 
MFG./

PKG. SIZE
TOTAL COST 

PER PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL COST 
PER PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. 

QTY.
MFG./

PKG. SIZE
TOTAL COST 

PER PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL COST 
PER PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

1  Gallon 275 1150 - Monolec® 
Syn Multi-Vehicle 
1150-BCC 330 Gal 

Tote

$9,820.80 
per 330 

Gallon Tote

$29.76 $8,184.00 Universal 
ATF 

12072245
55-Gal

$1,608.75 $29.25 $8,043.75 BASF Corp. 
Emgard 

2805

$1,485.00
55 Gal Drum

$27.00 $7,425.00 Mag 1 HD 
ATF

55 Gal

$825.00
55 Gal

$15.00 $4,125.00

2  Gallon 3500 1150 - Monolec® 
Syn Multi-Vehicle 
1150-BCC 330 Gal 

Tote

$9,820.80 
per 330 

Gallon Tote

$29.76 $104,160.00 Citgo 
Quatrasyn

$1,226.50
55 Gal Drum

$22.30 $78,050.00 OilPro MV 
ATF
Bulk

$6.95/Gal $6.95 $24,325.00

3  Gallon 8500 8700 - Monolec® 
Engine Oil

8700 BCC 330 Gal 
Tote

$4,276.80 
per 330 Gal 

Tote

$12.96 $110,160.00 Spectra 
Xtreme 

15W40 CK-4 
1207119
55-Gal

$990.00 $18.00 $153,000.00 Citgo 
Citgard 600 

15W40

$6.02/Gal 
Bulk

$6.02 $51,170.00 OilPro 
15W40

$5.25/Gal $5.25 $44,625.00

4 Gallon 1200 8521 - Monolec® 
Tetra-Syn™

8521 BCC Gal 
Tote

$10,513.80 
per Gal Tote

$31.86 $38,232.00 Spectra 
Xtreme 01 

5W20 
12064085

55-Gal

$1,045.00 $19.00 $22,800.00 Citgo 
Supergard 
5W20 Syn 

Blend

$5.01/Gal 
Bulk

$5.01 $6,012.00 OilPro 
5W20
Bulk

$4.40/Gal $4.40 $5,280.00

5 Gallon 225 Spectra 
Extreme 

10W30 CK-4 
12070969

55-Gall

$1,045.00 $19.00 $4,275.00 Citgo 
Supergard 

10W30

$381.70
55 Gal Drum

$6.94 $1,561.50 OilPro 
10W30

Bulk

$4.40/Gal $4.40 $990.00

6  Gallon 7000 Rad Cool 
50/50 

12018879
55 Gal

$1,017.50 $18.50 $129,500.00 Everlast 
HD 50/50

N/F

$4.10/Bulk $4.10 $28,700.00

7 Gallon 
Totes

3300 Kleen DEF 
12080944

55 Gal

$180.95 $3.29 $10,857.00 Musket 
Corp.

Morrow, 
GA

$1.15/Gal 
Bulk

$1.15 $3,795.00 TruDEF 
330 Gal 

Tote

$1.10/Gal $1.10 $3,630.00

NCH Corporation dba Certified Laboratories
Net 30 Days

5-7 Days Upon ARO

No Bid

Motor Oil – 10W30 Motor Oil per 
specifications in Section 3.3.3 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Coolant – Extended Life 
Coolant/Antifreeze per specifications 
in Section 3.4 or CCSD approved 
equivalent.

S A White Oil Co. Inc.
Net 30 Days

24 Hours

No Bid - Not available in Bulk

Taylor Enterprises, Inc. 
dba Taylor Lubricants

Net 30 Days
3 Working Days

No Bid

Motor Oil - Heavy Duty AE 15W40 
ONLY per specifications in Section 
3.3.1

Motor Oil - 5W20 Motor Oil per 
specifications in Section 3.3.2 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Lubrication Engineers, Inc.
Net 30 Days

3-5 Business Days

Vendor:
Terms:

Delivery Time:

No Bid

No Bid

DESCRIPTION

Synthetic Automatic Transmission 
Fluid per specifications in Section 3.1 
or CCSD approved equivalent.

Automatic Transmission Fluid per 
specifications in Section 3.2 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) - Per 
specifications in Section 3.5 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

GROUP 1 - FLUIDS 

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yellow.
*Does not meet CCSD specifications.
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District
B2045, Fleet Maintenance Fluids and Lubricants

ITEM 
#

UNIT OF 
MEASUR

E
EST 

QTY. 
MFG./

PKG. SIZE
TOTAL COST 

PER PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL COST 
PER PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. 

QTY.
MFG./

PKG. SIZE
TOTAL COST 

PER PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL COST 
PER PKG.

UNIT 
COST PER 
GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

NCH Corporation dba Certified Laboratories
Net 30 Days

5-7 Days Upon ARO

S A White Oil Co. Inc.
Net 30 Days

24 Hours

Taylor Enterprises, Inc. 
dba Taylor Lubricants

Net 30 Days
3 Working Days

Lubrication Engineers, Inc.
Net 30 Days

3-5 Business Days

Vendor:
Terms:

Delivery Time:

DESCRIPTION

1 Pound 1000 3752-Almagard Vari-
Purpose

3752-QD 120LB Keg

$918.00 per 
120LB Keg

$7.65 $7,650.00 Lithiplex 
120190627

120LB

$564.00 $4.70 $4,700.00 Citgo 
Lithoplex 

RT #2 
Grease

$274.80/120
LB Keg

$852.00/400
LB Drum

$2.29/LB
$2.13/LB

$2,130.00 Cam2 HT 
Red 

400LB/
120LB

$2.00/LB $2.00 $2,000.00

2 Gallon 110 704 - Monolec® 
Gear Lubricant
704-DR 400LB 

Drum  *Sold in LB 
not Gal

$2,256.00 
per 400LB 

Drum

$5.64 $620.40 Certop Gear 
Oil 85W140 
10194601

400LB

$1,300.00 $3.25 $357.50 Citgo 
Premium 

Gear 
85W140 
Gear Oil

$669.90
55 Gal Drum

$12.18 $1,339.80 OilPro 
85W140

55 Gallon

$546.00
55 Gal

$9.93 $1,092.30

1

Cost Plus 10% Gross Margin No Response

GROUP 3 – RELATED ITEMS

GROUP 2 – LUBRICANTS

Per Section 7.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in 
the event CCSD has failed to include an item(s), 
responding vendors are asked to provide a fee 
structure for additional, related items that may be 
purchased during the award period.  Vendors are to 
identify the pricing source and the associated fee 
structure in the space to the right. Example responses:  
X% discount below MSRP; X% discount below 
published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up.  

No Response No Bid

NOTE: Do not pick up empty containers Do not pick up empty containers

$114,767.30$269,006.40Total Cost Based off Estimated Total Usage $151,483.30$333,533.25

Grease – Chevron Delo Grease EP 
NLGI 2 per specifications in Section 
3.6 or CCSD approved equivalent. 

Lubricant –Universal Gear SAE 85W-
140 per specifications in Section 3.7 or 
CCSD approved equivalent.

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yellow.
*Does not meet CCSD specifications.
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District
B2045, Fleet Maintenance Fluids and Lubricants

ITEM 
#

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

EST 
QTY. 

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL COST 
PER PKG.

UNIT COST 
PER 

GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL COST 
PER PKG.

UNIT COST 
PER 

GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

1  Gallon 275 Valvoline 
Syn Gard 

ATF
Bulk

$14.50/Gal $14.50 $3,987.50 55 Gallon $2,475.00 $45.00 $12,375.00

2  Gallon 3500 Valvoline 
Dex/Merc 

ATF
Bulk

$4.50/Gal $4.50 $15,750.00 55 Gallon $638.16 $11.60 $40,600.00

3  Gallon 8500 Valvoline All 
Fleet E900 

15W-40
Bulk

$5.50/Gal $5.50 $46,750.00 55 Gallon $763.60 $13.88 $117,980.00

4 Gallon 1200 Valvoline 
SAE 5W-20

Bulk

$5.10/Gal $5.10 $6,120.00 55 Gallon $959.23 $17.44 $20,928.00

5 Gallon 225 Valvoline 
SAE 10W-30

Bulk

$5.10/Gal $5.10 $1,147.50 55 Gallon $727.06 $13.21 $2,972.25

6  Gallon 7000 Valvoline 
Zerex HD 

Nitrite Free 
50/50 Ext. 

Life. 275 Gal 
Tote

$1,647.25
Tote

$5.99 $41,930.00

7 Gallon 
Totes

3300 Valvoline 
Premium 
Blue DEF

330 Gal Tote

$528.00
Tote

$1.60 $5,280.00 275 Gal 
Tote

$1,127.88 $4.10 $13,530.00

Vendor:
Terms:

Delivery Time:

No Bid

Valvoline, Inc. 
dba Valvoline, LLC

Net 30 Days
Thursday Delivery Only. PO by Wednesday.

Wade Ford Inc.
Net 30 Days

2 Days

DESCRIPTION

Synthetic Automatic Transmission 
Fluid per specifications in Section 3.1 
or CCSD approved equivalent.

Automatic Transmission Fluid per 
specifications in Section 3.2 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Motor Oil - Heavy Duty AE 15W40 
ONLY per specifications in Section 3.3.1

Motor Oil - 5W20 Motor Oil per 
specifications in Section 3.3.2 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Motor Oil – 10W30 Motor Oil per 
specifications in Section 3.3.3 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

Coolant – Extended Life 
Coolant/Antifreeze per specifications in 
Section 3.4 or CCSD approved 
equivalent.

Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) - Per 
specifications in Section 3.5 or CCSD 
approved equivalent.

GROUP 1 - FLUIDS 

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yellow.
*Does not meet CCSD specifications.
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Tabsheet Cobb County School District
B2045, Fleet Maintenance Fluids and Lubricants

ITEM 
#

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

EST 
QTY. 

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL COST 
PER PKG.

UNIT COST 
PER 

GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

MFG./
PKG. SIZE

TOTAL COST 
PER PKG.

UNIT COST 
PER 

GALLON/
POUND

TOTAL COST 
PER EST. QTY.

Vendor:
Terms:

Delivery Time:

Valvoline, Inc. 
dba Valvoline, LLC

Net 30 Days
Thursday Delivery Only. PO by Wednesday.

Wade Ford Inc.
Net 30 Days

2 Days

DESCRIPTION

1 Pound 1000 Valvoline 
Crimson #2 

Grease
400 LB 
Drum

$740.00 
Drum

$1.85 $1,850.00 120LB $641.52 $5.34 $5,340.00

2 Gallon 110 Valvoline 
Heavy Duty 

Gear Oil 
85W-140, 

55 Gal 
Drum

$613.00 
Drum

$11.15 $1,226.50

1

Cost Plus 10%

GROUP 3 – RELATED ITEMS

GROUP 2 – LUBRICANTS

$124,041.50Total Cost Based off Estimated Total Usage

NOTE:

Per Section 7.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in the 
event CCSD has failed to include an item(s), responding 
vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for 
additional, related items that may be purchased during 
the award period.  Vendors are to identify the pricing 
source and the associated fee structure in the space to 
the right. Example responses:  X% discount below MSRP; 
X% discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus 
X% mark-up.  

No Bid

$213,725.25

10% Discount from List

Grease – Chevron Delo Grease EP NLGI 
2 per specifications in Section 3.6 or 
CCSD approved equivalent. 

Lubricant –Universal Gear SAE 85W-
140 per specifications in Section 3.7 or 
CCSD approved equivalent.

Awarded Vendor highlighted in Yellow.
*Does not meet CCSD specifications.
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