QUOTE 20170010

DRILL BITS
TABSHEET
SUPPLIER'S NAME CHEMSMART WHOLESALE HILTI MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY CO. PAXTON/PATTERSON
TERMS NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
PLEASE INDICATE REQUIRED LEAD TIME UPON RECEIPT OF |mmediate 35 Days 10-30 Days ARO
ORDER
o . ified, i L . ified, i . i b L . ified, if not, speci L . As Specified, if not, o .
ltem| CCSD# Description unit  |AS Secified, if not, UnitPrice |  Ext Price  |/\S SPecified, if not, specify mfg. & |\, i price | Ext, price |2 SPecifi PeCity | Unitprice | Ext. Price P Unit Price |  Ext. Price

specify mfg. & part # part # mfg. & part # specify mfg. & part #

Hilti item 233868 Twist drill bit HSS
1/16" (12) sold in pks of 12 each only
1 | BH-100 |Drill Bit, Steel, 1/16” x Jobber Ea 4507104 $ 0.65|$ 52.00 / manufactured in China $ 092]% 73.24 Hertel - MSC # 84579598 | $ 091 |$ 72.80 Stk# SPCL $ 170 | $ 136.00

Hilti item 233883 Twist drill bit HSS
3/32" (12) sold in pks of 12 each only
2 | BH-101 |Drill Bit, Steel, 3/32” x Jobber Ea 450T106 $ 068 |$ 48.96 / manufactured in China $ 101|$ 72.85 Hertel - MSC # 84579614 | $ 097 [ $ 69.84 Stk# SPCL $ 182 $ 131.04

Hilti item 234421 Twist drill bit HSS
1/8" (12) sold in pks of 12 each only /
3 | BH-102 |Drill Bit, Steel 1/8” x Jobber Ea 4507108 $ 0.68 | $ 204.00 manufactured in China $ 1.36 | $ 406.50 Hertel - MSC # 84579630 | $ 099 | $ 297.00 Stk# SPCL $ 195 | % 585.00

Hilti item 241283 Twist drill bit HSS
5/32" (12) sold in pks of 12 each only
4 | BH-104 |Drill Bit, Steel 5/32” x Jobber Ea 450T110 $ 092]$% 110.40 / manufactured in China $ 153 | % 183.12 Hertel - MSC # 84579655 | $ 105 $ 126.00 Stk# SPCL $ 224 | $ 268.80

Hilti 410620 Twist drill bit HSS COB
9/32" (6) sold in Pks of 6 each only
5 | BH-105 |Drill Bit, Steel 9/32” x Jobber Ea 4507118 $ 217 ($ 52.08 manufactured in China $ 548 | $ 131.52 Hertel - MSC # 84579739 | $ 281 $ 67.44 No Bid $ -

6 | BH-106 |Drill Bit, Steel 11/32” x Jobber Ea 4507122 $ 319 | % 76.56 No Bid $ - $ - Hertel - MSC # 84579770 | $ 357 |% 85.68 No Bid $ -

Hilti item 410619 Twist drill bit HSS
COB 17/64" (6) sold in pks of 6 each
7 | BH-107 |Drill Bit, Steel 17/64” x Jobber Ea 4507117 $ 191 | $ 45.84 / manufactured in China $ 475 | $ 113.95 Hertel - MSC # 84579721 | $ 224 | $ 53.76 No Bid $ -

Hilti item 410623 Twist drill bit HSS
COB 21/64" (6) sold in Pks of 6 each
8 | BH-108 |Drill Bit, Steel 21/64” x Jobber Ea 450T121 $ 276 | $ 66.24 / manufactured in China $ 760 [ $ 182.30 Hertel - MSC # 84579762 | $ 339 ($ 81.36 No Bid $ -

Hilti item 241356 Twist drill bit HSS
3/16" (12) sold in pks of 12 each only
9 | BH-109 |Drill Bit, Steel 3/16” x Jobber Ea 450T112 $ 1.08 | $ 162.00 / manufacutred in China $ 175 | $ 262.65 Hertel - MSC # 84579671 | $ 155 | % 232.50 Stk# SPCL $ 269 | $ 403.50

Hilti item 246474 Twist drill bit HSS
1/4" (12) sold in pks of 12 each only /
10 | BH-110 |Drill Bit, Steel 1/4” x Jobber Ea 450T116 $ 148 | $ 222.00 manufactured in China $ 223 (% 334.50 Hertel - MSC # 84579713 | $ 188 | $ 282.00 Stk# SPCL $ 383 (9% 574.50

Hilti item 273328 Twist drill bit HSS
5/16" (6) sold in Pks of 6 each only /
11 | BH-111 |Drill Bit, Steel 5/16” x Jobber Ea 450T120 $ 248 | $ 248.00 manufactured in China $ 5341 % 534.00 Hertel - MSC # 84579754 | $ 289 | $ 289.00 Stk# SPCL $ 590 | $ 590.00
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DRILL BITS
TABSHEET
SUPPLIER'S NAME CHEMSMART WHOLESALE HILTI MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY CO. PAXTON/PATTERSON
TERMS NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
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Item| CCSD# Description Unit 8 S_pecmed, e Unit Price Ext. Price (5 SR, O i Sy aeliy i 2) &2 Unit Price Ext. Price £5 ST, T ok ey Unit Price Ext. Price e S.p seliia, 717G Unit Price Ext. Price
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Hilti item 383956 Twist drill bit HSS
3/8" (6) sold in pks of 6 each /
12 | BH-112 (Drill Bit, Steel 3/8” x Jobber Ea 450T124 $ 3.43 343.00 manufactured in China $ 6.22 621.60 Hertel - MSC # 84579796 $ 3.83 383.00 Stk# SPCL $ 8.40 840.00
Hilti item 410601 Twist drill bit HSS
7/16" (6) sold in pks of 6 each /
13 | BH-113 |Drill Bit, Steel 7/16” x Jobber Ea 4507128 $ 5.42 130.08 manufactured in China $ 7.43 178.20 Hertel - MSC # 84579838 $ 5.00 120.00 Stk# SPCL $ 1134 272.16
Hilti item 410605 Twist drill bit HSS
1/2" (6) sold in pks of each /
14 | BH-114 (Drill Bit, Steel 1/2” x Jobber Ea 450T132 $ 7.42 445.20 manufactured in China $ 8.75 524.70 Hertel - MSC # 84579887 $ 5.99 359.40 Stk# SPCL $ 1439 863.40
Drill Bit, Steel 5/8” x Jobber 1000EF140-high speed
15 | BH-115 |No Award Ea steel $ 1077 258.48 No Bid $ - - | - MSC # 43481381 (Cobalt Co{f $  16.57 397.68 No Bid -
Drill Bit, Steel 3/4” x Jobber 1000EF148-high speed
16 | BH-116 |No Award Ea steel $ 1316 315.84 No Bid $ - - | - MSC # 43481365 (Cobalt Co| $  24.97 599.28 No Bid -
Hilti item 241360 Twist drill bit HSS
13/64" (12) sold in pks of 12 each
17 | BH-117 |Drill Bit, Steel 13/64” x Jobber Ea 450T113 $ 1.23 29.52 only / manufactured in China $ 1.86 44.64 Hertel - MSC # 84579689 $ 1.58 37.92 No Bid -
Drill Bit, Steel 1/4" x 12" x 1200A116-high speed
18 | BH-118 [Jobber No Award Ea steel $ 5.80 69.60 No Bid $ - - Hertel - MSC # 59926626 $ 7.84 94.08 No Bid -
Hilti item 241361 Twist drill bit HSS
7/32" (12) sold in pks of 12 each only
19 | BH-119 |Drill Bit, Steel 7/32” x Jobber Ea 4507114 $ 1.31 78.60 /' manufactured in China $ 2.03 121.62 Hertel - MSC # 84579697 $ 1.73 103.80 Stk# SPCL $ 3.30 198.00
Hilti item 410609 Twist drill bit HSS
COB 7/64" (12) sold in pks of 12
20 | BH-120 |Drill Bit, Steel 7/64” x Jobber Ea 4507107 $ 0.66 15.84 | each only / manfactured in China | $ 1.27 30.50 Hertel - MSC # 84579622 $ 0.96 23.04 No Bid -
Drill Bit, Steel 3/16" x 12 1200A112-high speed
21 | BH-121 [No Award Ea steel $ 5.14 61.68 No Bid $ - - Hertel - MSC # 59926667 $ 6.19 74.28 No Bid -
Drill Bit, Steel 1/2” x 12" 1200A132-high speed
22 | BH-122 (No Award Ea steel $ 2795 335.40 No Bid $ - - Hertel - MSC # 59927129 $ 2264 271.68 No Bid -
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Hilti item 61466 Masonry drill bit
TM 3/16"-6" sold as 1 each bits /
23 | BH-124 |Drill Bit, Masonry 3/16” x 6" Ea 160A1126 $ 161 ($ 161.00 manufactured Germany $ 537 ($ 537.00 | Triumph - MSC # 06686463 | $ 228 | $ 228.00 No Bid $ -

Hilti item 61470 Masonry drill bit
TM 1/4"-6" sold as 1 each /
24 | BH-125 |Drill Bit, Masonry 1/4” x 6” Ea 160A1166 $ 161 $ 161.00 manfactured in Germany $ 6.97 | $ 697.00 | Tru-Cut- MSC # 71212161 | $ 124 1% 124.00 No Bid $ -

Hilti item 61474 Masonry drill bit
TM 5/16"-6" sold as 1 each /
25 | BH-126 |Drill Bit, Masonry 5/16” x 6" Ea 160A1206 $ 210 $ 210.00 manufactured in Germany $ 9.69 [ $ 969.00 | Tru-Cut- MSC # 71212203 | $ 146 | $ 146.00 No Bid $ -

Hilti item 61477 Masonry drill bit
TM 3/8"-6" sold as 1 each /
26 | BH-127 |Drill Bit, Masonry 3/8” x 6” Ea 160A1246A $ 248 [ $ 59.52 manufactured in Germany $ 1150 (% 276.00 | Tru-Cut- MSC # 71212252 | $ 191 ($ 45.84 No Bid $ -

Hilti item 61483 Masonry drill bit
TM 1/2"-6" sold as 1 each /
27 | BH-128 |Drill Bit, Masonry 1/2” x 6” Ea 160A1326A $ 315($ 75.60 manufactured in Germany $ 1581 |$% 379.44 | Tru-Cut- MSC # 71212344 | $ 243 [ $ 58.32 Stk#142832 $ 078 [ $ 18.72

Hilti item 62898 Masonry drill bit
TM 5/8"-8" sold as 1 each /

28 | BH-129 |Drill Bit, Masonry 5/8” x 6” Ea 160A1406B $ 474 % 56.88 manufactured in Germany $ 1959 [ $ 235.08 | Tru-Cut- MSC # 71212401 | $ 446 | $ 53.52 No Bid $ -
29 | BH-130 |Drill Bit, Masonry 3/4” x 6” Ea 160A1486B $ 9.65 [ $ 115.80 No Bid $ - $ - Tru-Cut - MSC # 71212484 | $ 6.18 [ $ 74.16 No Bid $ -
Hilti item 61468 Masonry drill bit
Drill Bit, Steel 3/8” x 12” TM 3/8"-18" sold as 1 each /
30 | BH-131 [No Award Ea 1200C124 $ 1885($ 226.20 manufactured in Germany $ 2406 $ 288.72 Hertel - MSC #59927095 | $ 19.11 | $ 229.32 No Bid $ -
31 | BH-133 |Drill Bit, Masonry 3/16” x 12" Ea 170A11212 $ 838 (% 201.12 No Bid $ - $ - Tru-Cut - MSC # 61075347 | $ 488 | $ 117.12 No Bid $ -
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32 | BH-134 |Drill Bit, Masonry 1/4” x 12” Ea 160A11612 $ 386 (% 92.64 No Bid $ - $ - Tru-Cut - MSC # 71251169 | $ 463 | $ 111.12 No Bid -
33 | BH-135 |Drill Bit, Masonry 5/16” x 12” Ea 160A12012 $ 386 | $ 46.32 No Bid $ - $ - Tru-Cut - MSC # 71251201 | $ 453 | $ 54.36 No Bid -
Hilti item 61468 Masonry drill bit
TM 3/8"-18" sold as 1 each /
34 | BH-136 |Drill Bit, Masonry 3/8” x 12” Ea 160A12412A $ 500 | $ 60.00 manufactured in Germany $ 2406 |$ 288.72 | Tru-Cut- MSC # 71251243 | $ 513 [ $ 61.56 No Bid -
Hilti item 61472 Masonry drill bit
TM 1/2"-18" sold as 1 each /
35 | BH-137 |Drill Bit, Masonry 1/2” x 12" Ea 160A13212A $ 6.62 | $ 79.44 manufactured in Germany $ 3772 (% 452.64 | Tru-Cut - MSC # 71251326 | $ 6.74 | $ 80.88 No Bid -
36 | BH-138 |Drill Bit, Masonry 5/8” x 12” Ea 160A14012A $ 1002 |$ 120.24 No Bid $ - $ - Tru-Cut - MSC # 71251409 | $ 8.76 | $ 105.12 No Bid -
37 | BH-139 |Drill Bit, Masonry, 3/4” x 12” Ea 160A14812B $ 1269 (9% 152.28 No Bid $ - $ - Tru-Cut- MSC #71251482 | $ 1036 | $ 124.32 No Bid -
EXPLANATION OF AWARD:
Doesn't meet specs due to not being Titnium coated-Chemsmart #15, #16, #18, #21, #22 and #30; MSC #15, #16,
#18, #21, #22, and #30. Doesn't meet specs due to bidding wrong size- MSC #25: Paxton/Patterson #27. Does not
meet specs due to SDS Bit- Chemsmart #31 and #32.. Does not meet specs due to being made in Germany, Hilti
brand. Non Awarded items #15, #16, #18, #21, #22 and #30.
Per Section 5.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in
the event CCSD has failed to include an item(s),
responding vendors are asked to provide a fee
structure for additional, related items that may be
purchased during the award period. Vendors are to Minimum of 40% discount off Drill Bits 'only" will be discounted
identify the pricing source and the associated fee Hilti's 2016 List Price See 20% off of the MSCDirect.com
38 structure in the space to the right. Alternative Item price list website
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