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IFB B1907, Calculators

The Awarded Vendors are Highlighted in Yellow Page 1 of 10

Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Sargent Welch 
Item #

Unit Price Warranty

1-30 $10.25 2 Years $10.62 1 year 470046-430 $10.05 1 year replacement

31-60 $10.62 1 year $10.05 1 year replacement

61-90 $10.62 1 year $10.05 1 year replacement

91+ $10.62 1 year $10.05 1 year replacement
1-30 $102.48 2 Years $103.32 1 year MISC-TI10/TKT $100.50 1 year replacement

31-60 $103.32 1 year $100.50 1 year replacement

61-90 $103.32 1 year $100.50 1 year replacement

91+ $103.32 1 year $100.50 1 year replacement

1-30 $13.48 2 Years $16.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $13.98 1 year 470160-776 $13.22 1 year replacement

31-60 $16.55 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $13.98 1 year $13.22 1 year replacement

61-90 $15.25 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $13.98 1 year $13.22 1 year replacement

91+ $14.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $13.98 1 year $13.22 1 year replacement

1-30 $134.84 2 Years $139.75 1 year 470013-480 $132.20 1 year replacement

31-60 $139.75 1 year $132.20 1 year replacement

61-90 $139.75 1 year $132.20 1 year replacement

91+ $139.75 1 year $132.20 1 year replacement

1-30 $121.35 2 Years No Bid $124.32 1 year replacement

31-60 No Bid $124.32 1 year replacement

61-90 No Bid $124.32 1 year replacement

91+ No Bid $124.32 1 year replacement

1-30 $40.45 2 Years $40.78 1 year 470144-236 $41.44 1 year replacement

31-60 $40.78 1 year $41.44 1 year replacement

61-90 $40.78 1 year $41.44 1 year replacement

91+ $40.78 1 year $41.44 1 year replacement

Sargent-Welch/VWR
Quote # 8030817047

Net 30

4 TI-15 Explorer Plus Teacher Kit (includes 10 calculators, storage 
caddy, teacher's guide in English and Spanish, calculator poster, and 

transparency)

AFP Industries, Inc. Perimeter Office ProductsVendor Name

Terms Net 30 Net 30

1 TI-10 Calculator

2

3

TI-10 Teacher Kit (includes 10 calculators, storage caddy, teacher's 
guide in English and Spanish, calculator poster, and transparency)

TI-15 Explorer Plus Calculator

5 TI-108 Calculator (set of 30)

6 TI-108 Teacher Kit (includes 10 calculators, storage caddy, teacher's 
guide in English and Spanish, calculator poster, and transparency)

Scantex Business Systems

Net 30
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Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Sargent Welch 
Item #

Unit Price Warranty

Sargent-Welch/VWR
Quote # 8030817047

Net 30

AFP Industries, Inc. Perimeter Office ProductsVendor Name

Terms Net 30 Net 30

Scantex Business Systems

Net 30

1-30 $12.95 2 Years $17.66 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $13.42 1 year 470158-014 $12.70 1 year replacement

31-60 $17.25 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $13.42 1 year $12.70 1 year replacement

61-90 $16.55 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $13.42 1 year $12.70 1 year replacement

91+ $15.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $13.42 1 year $12.70 1 year replacement

1-30 $129.45 2 Years $134.16 1 year 470012-316 $127.00 1 year replacement

31-60 $134.16 1 year $127.00 1 year replacement

61-90 $134.16 1 year $127.00 1 year replacement

91+ $134.16 1 year $127.00 1 year replacement

1-30 $12.95 2 Years No Bid $12.70 1 year replacement

31-60 No Bid $12.70 1 year replacement

61-90 No Bid $12.70 1 year replacement

91+ No Bid $12.70 1 year replacement
1-30 $129.45 2 Years $134.16 1 year 470012-316 $127.00 1 year replacement

31-60 $134.16 1 year $127.00 1 year replacement

61-90 $134.16 1 year $127.00 1 year replacement

91+ $134.16 1 year $127.00 1 year replacement
1-30 $11.22 2 Years $15.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $11.63 1 year 470151-728 $10.97 1 year replacement

31-60 $15.25 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $11.63 1 year $10.97 1 year replacement

61-90 $13.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $11.63 1 year $10.97 1 year replacement

91+ $12.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $11.63 1 year $10.97 1 year replacement

1-30 $16.72 2 Years $21.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $17.33 1 year 470144-280 $16.41 1 year replacement

31-60 $21.25 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $17.33 1 year $16.41 1 year replacement

61-90 $20.55 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $17.33 1 year $16.41 1 year replacement

91+ $19.75 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $17.33 1 year $16.41 1 year replacement

7 TI-30XS Multi-View Calculator

12 TI 36XPRO

9 TI-30XS Multi-View EZ Spot Calculator (Yellow calculator with 
faceplate inscribed with the words "SCHOOL PROPERTY")

10 TI-30XS Multi-View EZ Spot Teacher Kit (includes 10 EZ Spot 
calculators, storage caddy, teacher's guide in English and Spanish, 

calculator poster, and transparency)

11 TI-30X IIS Calculator

8 TI-30XS Multi-View Teacher Kit (includes 10 calculators, storage 
caddy, teacher's guide in English and Spanish, calculator poster, and 

transparency)
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Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Sargent Welch 
Item #

Unit Price Warranty

Sargent-Welch/VWR
Quote # 8030817047

Net 30

AFP Industries, Inc. Perimeter Office ProductsVendor Name

Terms Net 30 Net 30

Scantex Business Systems

Net 30

1-30 $64.72 2 Years $67.08 1 year 470144-776 $61.85 1 year replacement

31-60 $67.08 1 year $61.85 1 year replacement

61-90 $67.08 1 year $61.85 1 year replacement
91+ $67.08 1 year $61.85 1 year replacement

1-30 No Bid No Bid 1 year replacement
31-60 No Bid No Bid 1 year replacement

61-90 No Bid No Bid 1 year replacement

91+ No Bid No Bid 1 year replacement
1-30 $127.29 2 Years Discontinued by TI No Bid-Discontinued $121.64 1 year replacement

31-60 Discontinued by TI No Bid-Discontinued $121.64 1 year replacement

61-90 Discontinued by TI No Bid-Discontinued $121.64 1 year replacement

91+ Discontinued by TI No Bid-Discontinued $121.64 1 year replacement

1-30 $1,335.51 2 Years $1,384.12 1 year 470217-736 $1,275.69 1 year replacement

31-60 $1,384.12 1 year $1,275.69 1 year replacement
61-90 $1,384.12 1 year $1,275.69 1 year replacement

91+ $1,384.12 1 year $1,275.69 1 year replacement
1-30 $127.29 2 Years $135.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $132.07 1 year 470217-734 $121.64 1 year replacement

31-60 $131.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $132.07 1 year $121.64 1 year replacement

61-90 $127.25 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $132.07 1 year $121.64 1 year replacement

91+ $126.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $132.07 1 year $121.64 1 year replacement
1-30 $1,335.51 2 Years No Bid-Discontinued 1 year $1,275.69 1 year replacement

31-60 No Bid-Discontinued 1 year $1,275.69 1 year replacement
61-90 No Bid-Discontinued 1 year $1,275.69 1 year replacement
91+ No Bid-Discontinued 1 year $1,275.69 1 year replacement
1-30 $137.55 2 Years $141.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $142.55 1 year 470151-722 $131.38 1 year replacement

31-60 $140.25 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $142.55 1 year $131.38 1 year replacement

61-90 $138.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $142.55 1 year $131.38 1 year replacement

91+ $137.55 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $142.55 1 year $131.38 1 year replacement

13 TI-73 Explorer Graphic Calculator

19 TI-89 Titanium Graphing Calculator

18 TI-84 Plus Silver EZ Spot Teacher Pack
 (includes 10 EZ Spot calculators and 1 guidebook with a classroom 

poster)
No Recommendation for Award

14 TI-82 VSH

15 TI-84 Plus Silver Edition Calculator
No Recommendation for Award

16 TI-84 Plus CE 
(includes 10 calculators and 1 guidebook with a classroom poster)

17 TI-84 Plus  CE
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Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Sargent Welch 
Item #

Unit Price Warranty

Sargent-Welch/VWR
Quote # 8030817047

Net 30

AFP Industries, Inc. Perimeter Office ProductsVendor Name

Terms Net 30 Net 30

Scantex Business Systems

Net 30

1-30 No Bid No Bid 1 year replacement

31-60 No Bid No Bid 1 year replacement

61-90 No Bid No Bid 1 year replacement

91+ No Bid No Bid 1 year replacement

1-30 $134.84 2 Years $145.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $141.21 1 year 470137-720 $128.82 1 year replacement

31-60 $143.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $141.21 1 year $128.82 1 year replacement

61-90 $143.75 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $141.21 1 year $128.82 1 year replacement

91+ $143.55 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $141.21 1 year $128.82 1 year replacement

1-30 $211.81 1 year 470134-344 $193.23 1 year replacement

31-60 $211.81 1 year $193.23 1 year replacement

61-90 $211.81 1 year $193.23 1 year replacement

91+ $211.81 1 year $193.23 1 year replacement

1-30 $156.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $142.55 1 year 470134-842 $131.38 1 year replacement

31-60 $153.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $142.55 1 year $131.38 1 year replacement

61-90 $150.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $142.55 1 year $131.38 1 year replacement

91+ $149.99 90 Days w/Perimeter OP & 1 Yr Mfg Warranty $142.55 1 year $131.38 1 year replacement

1-30 $214.08 1 year 470129-938 $195.28 1 year replacement

31-60 $214.08 1 year $195.28 1 year replacement

61-90 $214.08 1 year $195.28 1 year replacement

91+ $214.08 1 year $195.28 1 year replacement

1-30 $2,562.07 2 Years $2,585.99 1 year 470309-420 $2,447.28 1 year replacement
31-60 $2,585.99 1 year $2,447.28 1 year replacement

61-90 $2,585.99 1 year $2,447.28 1 year replacement

91+ $2,585.99 1 year $2,447.28 1 year replacement

20 TI-89T VSII

24 TI-Nspire CX CAS Bundle:  1 calculator w/single user software

25 TI-Nspire Navigator 30

21 TI-Nspire CX Handheld (Calculator only)

22 TI-Nspire CX Bundle:  1 calculator w/single user software

23 TI-Nspire CX CAS Handheld (Calculator only)



Tabsheet Cobb County School District
IFB B1907, Calculators

The Awarded Vendors are Highlighted in Yellow Page 5 of 10

Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty Sargent Welch 
Item #

Unit Price Warranty

Sargent-Welch/VWR
Quote # 8030817047

Net 30

AFP Industries, Inc. Perimeter Office ProductsVendor Name

Terms Net 30 Net 30

Scantex Business Systems

Net 30

1-30 $93.91 1 year 470120-618 $88.82 1 year replacement

31-60 $93.91 1 year $88.82 1 year replacement

61-90 $93.91 1 year $88.82 1 year replacement

91+ $93.91 1 year $88.82 1 year replacement

1-30 No Bid $13.85 1 year replacement

31-60 No Bid $13.85 1 year replacement

61-90 No Bid $13.85 1 year replacement

91+ No Bid $13.85 1 year replacement
28 Minimum % Discount off of Calculator Related Software % discount 10% 2 Years 33% - excluding items 

ending in 9 cents
0% 1 year replacement

29 Per ST&C 6.9 -In the event CCSD has failed to include an item(s), 
responding vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for additional, 
related items that may be purchased during the award period.  
Vendors are to identify the pricing source and the associated fee 
structure in the space provided on the attached Bid Form.  Some 
example responses are:  X% discount below MSRP; X% discount 
below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up.

% discount 10% 2 Years 33% - excluding items 
ending in 9 cents

0% 1 year replacement

26 TI CBR 2 Based Ranger

27 Graphic Link Package - TI-GL
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Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+
1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

4 TI-15 Explorer Plus Teacher Kit (includes 10 calculators, storage 
caddy, teacher's guide in English and Spanish, calculator poster, and 

transparency)

Vendor Name

Terms

1 TI-10 Calculator

2

3

TI-10 Teacher Kit (includes 10 calculators, storage caddy, teacher's 
guide in English and Spanish, calculator poster, and transparency)

TI-15 Explorer Plus Calculator

5 TI-108 Calculator (set of 30)

6 TI-108 Teacher Kit (includes 10 calculators, storage caddy, teacher's 
guide in English and Spanish, calculator poster, and transparency)

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty

$9.50 1 Year $9.69 1 year
$9.50 $9.66 1 year
$9.50 TI10BK $9.63 1 year
$9.50 SSI# 069005 $9.59 1 year

$95.00 1 Year $96.98 1 year
$95.00 $95.94 1 year
$95.00 TI10TK $95.01 1 year
$95.00 SSI# 069004 $95.01 1 year
$12.87 1 Year $12.77 1 year

$12.87 $12.75 1 year

$12.87 TI15RTL $12.72 1 year

$12.87 SSI# 038432 $12.69 1 year

$128.70 1 Year $127.60 1 year
$128.70 $127.50 1 year
$128.70 TI15TK $127.20 1 year
$128.70 SSI# 038431 $126.90 1 year
no bid $115.95 1 year
no bid $115.95 1 year
no bid $114.15 1 year
no bid $113.58 1 year
$39.78 1 Year $38.65 1 year
$39.78 $38.65 1 year

$39.78 TI108TK $38.05 1 year

$39.78 SSI# 064056 $37.86 1 year

School Specialty, Inc.
Quote # 7788658383

Valley Business Machines

Net 30Net 30
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Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Vendor Name

Terms

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+
1-30

31-60

61-90

91+
1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

7 TI-30XS Multi-View Calculator

12 TI 36XPRO

9 TI-30XS Multi-View EZ Spot Calculator (Yellow calculator with 
faceplate inscribed with the words "SCHOOL PROPERTY")

10 TI-30XS Multi-View EZ Spot Teacher Kit (includes 10 EZ Spot 
calculators, storage caddy, teacher's guide in English and Spanish, 

calculator poster, and transparency)

11 TI-30X IIS Calculator

8 TI-30XS Multi-View Teacher Kit (includes 10 calculators, storage 
caddy, teacher's guide in English and Spanish, calculator poster, and 

transparency)

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty

School Specialty, Inc.
Quote # 7788658383

Valley Business Machines

Net 30Net 30

$12.24 1 Year $12.18 1 year

$12.24 $12.16 1 year

$12.24 TI30XSMULTIVIEW $12.13 1 year

$12.24 SSI# 2002209 $12.08 1 year

$122.40 1 Year $121.80 1 year

$122.40 $121.60 1 year

$122.40 TI30XSMVTKYEL $121.30 1 year

$122.40 SSI# 2002208 $120.80 1 year

$12.24 1 Year $12.18 1 year
$12.24 $12.16 1 year
$12.24 TI30XSMULTIVIEW $12.13 1 year
$12.24 SSI# 2002209 $12.08 1 year

$122.40 1 Year $121.80 1 year
$122.40 $121.60 1 year
$122.40 TI30XSMVTKYEL $121.30 1 year
$122.40 SSI# 2002208 $120.80 1 year
$11.00 1 Year $10.61 1 year

$11.00 $10.59 1 year

$11.00
TI30XIIS

$10.54 1 year

$11.00 SSI# 033-6945 $10.51 1 year

$16.14 1 Year $15.81 1 year

$16.14 $15.73 1 year
$16.14 TI36XPRO $15.65 1 year
$16.14 SSI# 1514431 $15.65 1 year
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Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Vendor Name

Terms

1-30

31-60

61-90
91+

1-30
31-60

61-90

91+
1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60
61-90

91+
1-30

31-60

61-90

91+
1-30

31-60
61-90
91+
1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

13 TI-73 Explorer Graphic Calculator

19 TI-89 Titanium Graphing Calculator

18 TI-84 Plus Silver EZ Spot Teacher Pack
 (includes 10 EZ Spot calculators and 1 guidebook with a classroom 

poster)
No Recommendation for Award

14 TI-82 VSH

15 TI-84 Plus Silver Edition Calculator
No Recommendation for Award

16 TI-84 Plus CE 
(includes 10 calculators and 1 guidebook with a classroom poster)

17 TI-84 Plus  CE

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty

School Specialty, Inc.
Quote # 7788658383

Valley Business Machines

Net 30Net 30

$63.65 1 Year $60.58 1 year
$63.65 $59.98 1 year
$63.65 TI 36XPRO $59.98 1 year
$63.65 SSI# 027615 $59.98 1 year
no bid Discontinued by TI
no bid Discontinued by TI
no bid Discontinued by TI
no bid Discontinued by TI

discontinued by TI Discontinued by TI

discontinued by TI Discontinued by TI

discontinued by TI Discontinued by TI

discontinued by TI Discontinued by TI
$1,251.24 1 Year $1,237.00 1 year
$1,251.24 $1,236.00 1 year
$1,251.24 TI84PLUSCETPK $1,235.00 1 year
$1,251.24 SSI# 1516414 $1,234.00 1 year
$118.78 1 Year $117.94 1 year

$118.78 $117.94 1 year

$118.78 TI84PlusCE $117.88 1 year

$118.78 SSI# 1516415 $117.83 1 year
discontinued by TI Discontinued by TI
discontinued by TI Discontinued by TI
discontinued by TI Discontinued by TI
discontinued by TI Discontinued by TI

$129.00 1 Year $127.59 1 year

$129.00 $127.55 1 year
$129.00 TI89TITANIUM $127.46 1 year
$129.00 SSI# 1502714 $127.46 1 year
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Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Vendor Name

Terms

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30
31-60

61-90

91+

20 TI-89T VSII

24 TI-Nspire CX CAS Bundle:  1 calculator w/single user software

25 TI-Nspire Navigator 30

21 TI-Nspire CX Handheld (Calculator only)

22 TI-Nspire CX Bundle:  1 calculator w/single user software

23 TI-Nspire CX CAS Handheld (Calculator only)

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty

School Specialty, Inc.
Quote # 7788658383

Valley Business Machines

Net 30Net 30

no bid Discontinued by TI
no bid Discontinued by TI
no bid Discontinued by TI
no bid Discontinued by TI

$129.00 1 Year $124.90 1 year

$129.00 $124.90 1 year
$129.00 TINSPIRECX $124.88 1 year
$129.00 SSI# 1400566 $124.86 1 year
$191.00 1 Year $189.36 1 year
$191.00 $188.50 1 year
$191.00 TINSPIRECXTCHBU $187.44 1 year
$191.00 SSI# 1528594 $187.40 1 year
$126.89 1 Year $127.43 1 year

$126.89 $127.40 1 year
$126.89 TINSPIRECXCAS $127.40 1 year
$126.89 SSI# 1400569 $127.35 1 year
$71.28* 1 Year $191.50 1 year
71.28 $190.50 1 year
71.28 TINSPIRECASSW $189.40 1 year
71.28 SSI# 1528470 $189.40 1 year

$1847.44* 1 Year $2,373.00 1 year
$1,847.44 $2,369.48 1 year
$1,847.44 TINSPIRECXNAV15 $2,365.00 1 year
$1,847.44 SSI # 1456147 $2,365.00 1 year
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Item # Description Qty 
Breaks

Vendor Name

Terms

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+

1-30

31-60

61-90

91+
28 Minimum % Discount off of Calculator Related Software % discount

29 Per ST&C 6.9 -In the event CCSD has failed to include an item(s), 
responding vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for additional, 
related items that may be purchased during the award period.  
Vendors are to identify the pricing source and the associated fee 
structure in the space provided on the attached Bid Form.  Some 
example responses are:  X% discount below MSRP; X% discount 
below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up.

% discount

26 TI CBR 2 Based Ranger

27 Graphic Link Package - TI-GL

Unit Price Warranty Unit Price Warranty

School Specialty, Inc.
Quote # 7788658383

Valley Business Machines

Net 30Net 30

$84.13 1 Year $86.00 1 year
$84.13 $85.00 1 year
$84.13 TICBR2 $84.00** 1 year
$84.13 SSI # 1623374E $84.00** 1 year
$12.88 1 Year $14.95 1 year
$12.88 $13.95 1 year
$12.88 $12.95 1 year
$12.88 TIGLINKUSB $12.90 1 year
36% 3% above cost 1 year

36% 3% above cost 1 year

*Bid Wrong Item **Awarded to vendor with lowest price 
on qty 1-30
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